PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

R s
Office: 903.693.0333 _5"'\:10":” 314 W. Wellington
Fax:  903.693.9366 e RS Carthage, Texas 75633

A COUNT‘ y-:

Sheriff Kevin Lake

03-01-2019
HONORABLE COMMISSIONER’S COURT

Re: Food Bid

It is my recommendation the below listed companies be awarded contracts for food items for the 1 April
2019 through 30 September 2019 period.

Sysco
Flowers Foods

Respectfully,

Mool Grndlen

Lt. Tina C. McMullen

Honesty, Integrity, Service



PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
‘-
Office: 903.693.0333 S 314 W, Wellington
Fax: 903.693.9366 ol LTEATNG Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Kevin Lake

February 12, 2019

Flowers_ Foods
Attn: Kari Beaver

1200 W, Erwin

Tyler, Tx 75702

Oy A
Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you séll. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column:. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If yﬁu do riot wish to submiit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

o a N -

The items bid selected for purchase‘%lﬁbe for a six month period, beginning April 1, 2019 through September 30, 2019,
It Is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by 26 February 2019. You may return by malil,
email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and.consideration.

Do CrrErmdlan

Lt. Tina €. McMullen, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detentitn Centér
tina.mcmullen@co.panola.tx.us
903-693-0359 X-266

COMPANY NAME Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC

NO BID SUBMITTED

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED _ v

Honesty, Integrity, Service



PANOLA COUNTY JAIL
FOOD ITEMS BID-SHEET
April 1, 2019 THROUGH September 30, 2019

ITEM NUNIBERS AND PRICES MUST BE LISTED

ITEM # BRAND PKG.SIZE DESCRIPTION PRICE
101-1038-0 BREAD 24 0z |White Sandwich Bread $1.70 per loaf
102-1880-0 BREAD 20 b0z |Wheat Sandwich Breadhoney wheat thin $1.80 per loaf
101-2376-0 BREAD 8 ct. Hamburger Buns $1.49 perpkg .
101-2388-0 BREAD 8 ct. _ [Hot Dog Buns $1.49 per pkg
102-1508.0 . _ |BREAD 20 2oz ([Honey Wheat Breadhonsywheat split top $1.99 per loaf _
100-2556-0 |BREAD 412 |BulkSD 20 count . $4.10 per pkg_
611-2908-0 — |BREAD | 12ct.  |Wontiomgy DNR RO $1.49 per pkg
100-2670-0 BREAD 30.ct. |4" Bulk Plain _ $4.29 per pkg
100-2912-0 BREAD 24 ct. |Kxyskal Rolls Flowers $2.54 per pkg
101-2536-0 BREAD 8ct.  PHetes Jumbo Sunbeam 4 172" buns $1.99 per pkg

nd, Market
Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC
1200 West Erwin Street

Tyler, Tx 75702

903-595-2421



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRM 1295
1lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2019-467415
Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC
Tyler, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 03/25/2019
being filed.
County of Panola Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

#2019-03
bread items
4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check cnly if there is NO Interested Party. .

6 UNSWORN DECLARATION

My name is 4—7 ;4—/_49,0@ , and my date of birth is / 7—"3"/9//'
My addressis .~ 22 A/, é’—:;&/‘/&r j)z ; S o Lo I 7 ., B

(street) ’ (city) (state) (zip code) (country)

| declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed in e % County, State of /a_.Jé - , on theZ > day of dZZga#’ , 20/ /‘Z ;

(month) (year)

(Declarant

Signature of authorized agent Nntracting business entity

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.1.39f8039¢



PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

ERJ, .
Office: 903.693.0333 ‘-.»"‘;N;.-'f‘f 314 W. Wellington
Fax: 903.693.9366 e A Carthage, Texas 75633

e

Sheriff Kevin Lake

February 12, 2019

Sysco
Attn: Chad McElyea

4577 Estes Parkway

Longview, Tx 75603

Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six month period, beginning April 1, 2019 through September 30, 2019.
It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by 26 February 2019. You may return by mail,
email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

o Ut  Qlen

Lt. Tina C. McMullen, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detention Center

tina.mcmullen@co.panola.tx.us
903-693-0359 X-266

COMPANY NAME SL_U/\S O

NO BID SUBMITTED

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED /A‘/M%
J/

Honesty, Integrity, Service




Food Bid Sheet

April 1, 2019 Thru September 30, 2019

Must use Excell Spreadsheet (Typed) and fill in "all "' information
**Electronic File Can Be Sent For Typing Purposes if Requested**

6/#10 APPLESAUCE UNSWEETEND $ 24.50 4062030 6#10 Sysco Classic
1/15 LB BACON BUFFET 18-22 L/Q SLCD FZ $ 49,92 5494354 1/15 Lbs Ranch& Grill
6/5 LB BAKING PWDR $ 3.99 4888129 1/5 Lbs Gilster
1/1 LB BASE BEEF NO MSG ADDED TFF $ 33.91 4944260 6/1 Lb Sysco Imp
1/1 LB BASE CHICKEN NO MSG ADDED TFF $ 28.94 4944534 6/1 Lb Sysco Imp
1/50Z BASIL LEAVES $ 5.99 5228341 1/5 oz McCormic
6/#10 BEAN BKD W/PORK $ 22.99 5501952 6#10 Showboat
1/20 LB BEAN GREAT NRTHRN $ 21,85 4062360 6#10 Sysco Classic
1/50 LB BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN $ 23.87 4183968 . 1/50 Lbs Sysco Classic
2/5LB AV BEEF FOR STEW VP FZ $ 2.31alb 1813177 4/5 Lbs Sysco Classic
B/10#AV BEEF GRND FINE 80/20 2.08aLB 566838 4/10 Lbs Fire Classic
30/5.330z BEEF PATTY $ 59.99 2580058 60/5.3 oz Fire Classic
12/2 1B ' BOLOGNA TURKEY 1 OZ SLCD FZ $ 1.58 4812400 2/5-6lb whole
6/5 LB " |BREAD CRUMBS PLN $ 27.94 6675722 1/25 Lbs Texas
6/5 1B BROWNIE MIX $ 27.98 1242439 6/5 Lbs Sysco Rel
72/4 OZ BURRITQ BEEF & BEAN RED CHILT $ 29.89 9936170 72/4 oz Lil Juan
4/5 LB CABBAGE SHRED SEP COLOR $ 15.98 1675701 4/8 Lbs Imp Fresh
6/5 1B CAKE MIX WHI $ 23.72 5301601 6/5 Lbs Sysco Rel
1/50 LB CARROT BULK JUMBO $ 24.99 2227015 1/50 Lbs Packer
6/#10 CARROT SLCD TFF $ 24.74 4257986 6#10 Sysco Rel
1/6 CT CELERY FRSH $ 19.99 1508300 Imp Fresh

1/30 OZ CELERY SALT NO MSG $ 7.72 5228465 1/30 oz McCormic
4/51b CHEESE AMER YLW 120 SL $ 39.88 6697114 4/5 Lbs BBRL ClIs
4/5 LB CHEESE CHED FTHR SHRED R/F $ 42.86 2404135 4/5 L bs Casasolana
70-90/10LB CHICKEN TERDER FRITER BREADED $ 30.75 8391940 1/10 Lbs Tyson RL
4/10 LB CHICKEN BRST RAND B/S MAR FZ $ 45.97 7203474 4/10 Lbs Sysco Cls
1/10 LB CHICKEN DICED WHI DARK 172" FC % 25.80 2976528 2/5 Lbs Tyson RI
2/5LB AV CHICKEN NUGGET $ 20.98 8412780 2/5 Lbs Tyson R
9/16 OZ CHIP POTATO ORGNL RIDGED $ 19,98 2077352 9/1 Lb BBRLCLS
18/1 [B COFFEE GRMT $ 98.96 6957799 18/14 oz Citavo
214/1.5 OZ COOKIE DGH CHQC CHIP 3 30.84 1614744 240/ 1oz Sysco Rel
4/350Z CORN FLAKES $ 13.50 6709307 4/35 oz Hosptly
6/#10 CORN WHL KERNEL $ 27.96 4107520 6#10 Sysco Classic
48/40z CORN DOGS TURKEY $ 27.88 1738822 72/4 oz Sysco Classic
4/1 GA DRESSING RANCH TFF $ 35.50 4537645 4/1 GAL Sysco Classic
4/1 GA DRESSING SALAD TFF $ 26.97 4002473 4/1 Gal Sysco Rel
12/18 OZ DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH TFF $ 2591 4138590 12/24 oz Sahar B
1715 D2 EGG WHI MED GRD AA LOOSE $ 12.84 2105815 1/15 DZ WHLFCLS
210LB ELBOW MACARONI ELBOW PASTA $ 19.99 9688367 2/10 Lbs Arezzio
1/25 LB FLOUR H&R AP $ 12.88 8378111 1/50 Lbs Sysco Classic
2/5 LB FRANKS 8/1 TURKEY FZ 6" $ 12.84 533485 2/5 Lbs BTRBALL
6/5 LB FRIES 1/2 IN CC RTU TFF FZ $ 19.50 1994294 6/5 Lbs Sysco Rei
473502 FROSTED FLAKES $ 14.92 6781587 4/35 oz Hosptly
1/32 07 GARLIC CHPD WATER TFF $ 32.94 7127293 6/32 oz Arezzio
6/14 OZ GRAVY MIX BRWN $ 19.99 8558215 6/15 oz Sysco Imp
2/10#AV HAM BUFFET 35% SMKD $ 1.58alb 6992384 2/10 lbs AV BBRLREL
1/24ct ICEBERG LETTUCE $ 24.75 1908318 1/24 ct SYFPNAT




400/10 GM JELLY VAR #10 CUP $ 18.88 5258835 400/10 GM Sysco Rel
70/4 OZ JUICE DRANGE CARTON 100% FZ $ 18.99 2120533 96/4 oz Ardmore
6/#10 KETCHUP 29% CONC TFF $ 22.95 4005989 6#10 Hunts
4/960z MAC & CHEESE $ 56.98 1614452 4/8 Lbs Sysco Classic
30/1 LB MARGARINE SOLIDS $ 21,99 4549099 30/1 Lb WHLFCLS
900/5 GM MARGARINE SPREAD WHIPPED CUP $ 18.97 4546949 900/5 GM WHLFCLS
4/1 GA MAYO HD $ 22.95 4002432 4/1 GA Sysco Rel
6/1 GA MILK 2% $ 15.84 4676280 4/1 GA WHLFCLS
6/1 GA MILK WHL $ 17.76 4676306 4/1 GA WHLFCLS
1/10 1B MUSHROOM BUTTON SM $ 19.86 1182229 1/10 Lbs IMPFRSH
4/1 GA MUSTARD PLAS RED BOY $ 12.99 4728858 4/1 GA sysco Rel
1/50 LB OATS QUICK $ 28.86 6561138 1/50 Lbs Gilster
6/1 GA QIL SOY SALAD TFF $ 18.80 4119079 1/35 Lbs Sysco Rel
1/10 LB ONION YLW MED $ 15.99 1098516 1/50 Lbs IMPFRSH
6/5 LB PANCAKE MIX BUTTERMILK $ 20.84 2810432 6/5 Lbs Sysco Rel
1/10 0Z PARSLEY FLAKES % 4,23 5229265 1/10 oz McCormic
2/5LB AV PASTA EGG NOODLES 1/4" $ 13.78 5204609 2/5 Lbs Arezzio
1/20LB PASTA SPAGHETTI $ 19,75 4862983 2/10 Lbs Arezzio
6/5 LB PEANUT BUTTER CRMY TFF $ 43.86 4009189 6/5 Lbs STRATFD
6/#10 PEAS & CARROT $ 34.85 4030870 6#10 Sysco Classic
1/20 LB PEAS GRN IQF GRD B $ 18.98 7106503 1/20 Lbs Fineline
1/5.B PEPPER BLK GRND BULK $ 12,74 5935689 3/5 Lbs Sysco Classic
1/18 OZ PEPPER WHI GRND $ 3.99 5229455 1/18 oz Sysco Classic
6/#10 POTATO DICED $ 27.80 4108866 6#10 Sysco Classic
1/50 LB POTATO IDAHO RUSSET 100 CT TFF $ 15.99 1008473 1/100 ct Packer
6/#10 POTATO INST MASHED W/VITAMIN C $ 45.81 5832730 6#10 Truerec
6/#10 POTATO YAM CUT TFF $ 33.96 4114625 6#10 Sysco Classic
6/#10 PUDDING VANILLA $ 31.79 7295256 6#10 Sysco Rel
4/350Z RAISIN BRAN $ 16.43 6732788 4/35 oz Hosptly
1/1 GA RELISH SWEET TFF $ 33.86 4521480 4/1 GA BBRLCLS
4/3502 RICE CRISPIES $ 14,67 6709455 4/35 oz Hosptly
1/50 LB RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN POLY $ 16.50 4671434 1/50 Lbs Sysco Classic
1/2518B SALT IODIZED GRANULAR TFF $ 4.93 4540373 1/25 Lbs Sysco Classic
16/#10 SAUCE TOMATO CONC TFF $ 20.99 5096441 6#10 Sysco Ott
1/50 LB SHORTENING CAKE & ICING $ 36.85 4684250 1/50 Lbs Sysco Classic
4/5 LB SOUR CREAM GRD A HVY BODY TFF $ 23.60 1186253 4/5 Lbs Daisy
1/50 LB SUGAR GRANULATED EXTRA FINE IMP $ 27.99 4782694 1/50 Lbs Sysco Classic
1/25 LB SUGAR LIGHT BRWN $ 20.64 1854694 1/25 Lbs BKRSCLS
200/1.5 0Z SYRUP PANCAKE & WAFFLE CUP TFF $ 9.86 3911490 100/1 QZ Sysco Rel
32/30Z TEA AUTOBREW $ 29.93 5097597 32/3 oz HSE REC
443502 TOASTED OATS $ 14.88 6732754 4/35 oz Hosptly
1/25 1B TOMATO 5X6 $ 19.99 1763432 1/25 Lhs IMPFRSH
6/#10 TOMATO DICED 3/4" IN JUICE TFF $ 22.96 4978872 6#10 Sysco Classic
6/#10 TROPICAL FRUIT SALAD $ 33.15 4467845 6#10 Margis
2/9#AV TURKEY BRST OVEN PREPARED SKNLS 1.88a LB 1355528 2/9 Lbs AV BBRL
6/#10 VEGETABLES MIXED TFF ' $ 27.96 4112926 6#10 Sysco Classic
4/1 GA VINEGAR WHI DISTILLED 40 GRAIN $ 16.84 4113049 6/1 GA Sysco Classic
100/1 oz Syrup Sugar Free 15.99 5932280
Drink Mix Orange 25.91 4138608 12 /24 0z Sarah B
Drink Mix Lemonade 25.91 4138632 12/24 oz Sarah B




